
AUGUST 2025 MEETING MINUTES 
	 Tuesday, August 5, 2025-6:30 PM 


CALL TO ORDER 

A meeting oft he Mustang band Boosters was called to order order in the MHS Auditorium at 
6:32 pm on Tuesday, August 5, 2025 by MHS Band Booster President Kristin Richter.


QUORUM - Yes 

ATTENDEES 

In Person 

Michelle LeMaster, Robert LeMaster Marian Jackson, David Ribble, Christie Atkinson, Jaime 
Winters, JJ Winters, Dennis Taylor, Stephanie Taylor, Melanie Ridinger, Amberlynn Cornell, 
Jaqueline DeGiusti, Natalie Gordon, Stephanie McGee, Natalie Thomas Deborah Cady, Erin 
Brockwell, Elvira, Gibbon, Robbyn Glinsmann, Samantha Stepanek, Neil Stepanek, Sarah 
Bastings, Marivette T, Charles Toombs, Tara Toombs, Bobby Conn, Monica Rochelle, Maggie 
Davis, Jenny Matthew’s, Susan Current 


Virtual 

Alex Ramos, BG, Justin Karpilo, Kelly Landrith, Kendra Horner, Linda Craddock, Matthew 
Tonay, Melanie Chronister, Melanie Hix, Michelle Yoder, Nina Sanderson, Rachel Bankston, 
Rebecca Langley, Jennifer Diel, Lori Knowels, Mark Fondavilla, 


SECRETARY REPORT 

Meeting minutes from July 2025 booster meeting were presented by Michelle LeMAster, 
discussed. All booster meeting minutes can be viewed on the band booster web page mustang 
band booster.com. Motion to approve meeting minutes made by Kristin Richter, approved by 
Nate Richter, seconded by Bobby Conn.


TREASURERS REPORT 


Treasurer report presented by Rachel Robins. Went over financials. Fireworks sales were 
successful, Balance in Checking, a little over $56k, Money Market $505.54. Out going money 
to show and props being paid. Financials can be reviewed on the band booster band page. 
Motion to approve financials made by Kristin Richter. Approved by Shanelle Maxwell , 
seconded by Christina Tonay.
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FIREWORKS REPORT 

Robbyn Glinsmann presented the final numbers for the fireworks stand. Gross profit made 
$76063.85, before sales tax and insurnace. Total profit made was $24 197.83, Tips earned, 
$2149.41. The The fireworks order is already going out for next year’s sale, June 27-July 4, 
2026. Robbyn also went over the importance of volunteering for these events.  

MERCHANDISE REPORT 

Alexis Thach presented on the sales for section jacket stores, closes EOM August. Jackets will 
be delivered mid September - October 3 at the latest. 


CAR WASH 

Ticket sales go directly in to student accounts. All volunteer spots for adults and students use 
be filled up to account for the success of the carwashes. Help getting the supplies for all 
locations is needed and return to concessions after its over. 


VOLUNTEERS 


Volunteers are needed for for all events, fireworks worked on a skeleton crew. Challenge to 
parents to help support the band program. Pigskin Preview Aug 25, Volunteers needed.


PRESIDENTS REPORT 

Food Fundraisers coming up, Rush Bowls 13th, Panda Express 21st,  Ted’s Cafe Escondido 
26th. All monies raised go the overall band account. Holly helping on all food fundraisers, Little 
Caesar’s food kit fundraiser will benefit individual accounts, Starts Sept 1. 


Still needing a funnel cake coordinator, medical coordinator, Dennis Taylor has volunteered to 
be the push crew coordinator, Deborah Caty, hydration in training coordinator.


Student Service hours, Regional Food Bank student positions still open. 


Directors Dinners- Openings still open for two days to help feed our directors


Community preview night for HOPE, August 29.We will taking donations for plates, napkins, 
plasticware, Liquid IV and Gatorade packets.  Admission is free. 


30/60/90 

Events over the next 30, 60 and 90 days. All events and dates can be found on the Band App 
and mustangbandbooster.com, please make yourself aware of dates. 


DIRECTOR’S REPORT 

Mr Edgmon presented on the progress of the Band through summer camps. Parents, please 
be patient with emails. Band program needs to make themselves aware, known, that we are 
part of the band, separate from the athletic program. 

Mattress fundraiser presented, one day, August 24th, $10,000 goal.
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Next meeting to be held on September 2, 2025 at 6:30 pm in the Mustang Band Room. Motion 
to adjourn made at 7:32 pm by Kristin Richter, approved by Nate Richter, Seconded by Bobby 
LeMaster, Robbyn Glinsmann


-Michelle LeMaster- MHS Band Booster Secretary 


3


